‘Gig Harbor
City Council Meeting

June 8, 1998

7:00 P.M., CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS






AGENDA FOR GIG HARBOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING
June 8, 1998 - 7:00 p.m.

CALL TO ORDER:

APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

CORRESPONDENCE / PROCLAMATIONS:
1. Hire a Veteran Month.

OLD BUSINESS:

1. Second Reading of Ordinance — Amendments to Title 15 GHMC (Building Code
Update).

2. Second Reading of Two Ordinances — Management of Jerisich Dock.

NEW BUSINESS:

1. Purchase Authorization — Public Works Equipment.

2. Liquor License Assumption — JT’s Original Louisiana Bar-B-Que.,

3. Liquor License Renewals - Harbor Humidor; Puerto Vallarta Restaurant; Round Table
Pizza.

PUBLIC COMMENT/DISCUSSION:

COUNCIL COMMENTS: ' !

STAFF REPORTS:

ANNOUNCEMENTS OF OTHER MEETINGS:
APPROVAL OF BILLS:

EXECUTIVE SESSION: For the purpose of discussing property acquisition per RCW
42.30.110, (b) and litigation per RCW 42.30.110 ().

ADJOURN:






DRAFT

REGULAR GIG HARBOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING OF MAY 26, 1998

PRESENT: Councilmembers Ekberg, Young, Platt, Dick, Picinich, Owel, Markovich and
Mayor Wilbert.

CALL TO ORDER: 7:04 p.m.

PUBLIC HEARING: Proposed Zoning District Amendments — Purdy Area.

Mayor Wilbert opened the public hearing on this item at 7:01 p.m. and introduced Ray Gilmore,
Planning Director. Mr. Gilmore explained the reason this ordinance was being reintroduced was
to satisfy the statutory requirement to hold two public hearings not less than 30 days apart on any
pre-annexation zoning. He gave an overview of the Planning Commission’s recommendations

for zoning for the area.

Mayor Wilbert asked if anyone wished to speak. No one came forward and the hearing was
closed at 7:05 p.m.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

MOTION: Move approval of the minutes of May 11, 1998 as presented.
Picinich/Owel - unanimously approved.

CORRESPONDENCE/PROCLAMATIONS: None scheduled.

OLD BUSINESS:

1. Reintroduction of the First Reading of Ordinance — Planning Commission

Recommendation — Preannexation Zoning Plan for the Purdy Community UGA. Ray
Gilmore explained that this was the first public hearing on these recommendations and

that the second public hearing would be held at the July 13" meeting. He added that the
ordinance would also return on July 13" as a reintroduction of a first reading.

NEW BUSINESS:

1. First Reading of Ordinance — Amendments to Title 15 GHMC (Building Code Update).
Steve Bowman, Building Official/Fire Marshal, explained that every three years the
Washington State Building Code Council, in conjunction with the Legislature, adopts
new codes. He said that the latest revisions were set to become effective on July 1, 1998
and gave an overview of the proposed amendments. He answered Council’s questions
and explained that this would return for a second reading at the next meeting.

2. Skateboard Park Resolution — IAC. Wes Hill,. Public Works Director, presented this
resolution confirming Council’s support of project development for a skateboard park.




He explained that the resolution was necessary for consideration by the IAC Technical
Committee, in conjunction with the grant application, to assist in building the skateboard
park. He gave a brief description of the proposed project and answered questions.

MOTION:  Move to approve Resolution No. 517.
Markavich/Picinich ~ unanimously approved.

3. Harborview Street End Project Resolution — IAC. Wes Hill explained that this was a
second resclution confirming Council’s support for the Harborview Street End Project for
IAC’s consideration for grant funding. He explained that this grant only covered the
street-end project itself, and funding for improvements to the street would need to come
from another source.

MOTION: Move to approve Resolution No. 518.
Markovich/Picinich — unanimously approved.

4, First Reading of Ordinance — Public Docks. Mark Hoppen, City Administrator,
explained that this ordinance and the one following address the management of Jerisich

Dock. He said that while reviewing the current code, several recommendations arose
from Public Works, Law Enforcement and Administrative Staff. He added that one
recommendation was 1o change the current 24 continuous hour limit to 48 hours to more
appropriately reflect recreational boating patterns. Another recommendation was to post
the time for payment as anytime after 7:00 p.m. to 7:00 a.m. to enable the police to make
a routine check in the evening for those boaters who may not have posted their payment
slip in their window. The final recommendation was to delete the language that refers to
the 65° loading and unloading space. He answered questions regarding how the funds are
collected and tracked. Council made recommendations to modify the hours from 7:00
p.m. to 5:00 p.m. and to add language to reflect usage of the loading zone for the waste
disposal facilities. This ordinance will return at the next council meeting with the
recommended amendments.

5. First Reading of Ordinance — City Dock Fees. This ordinance was discussed during the
previous agenda item, and will return with modifications for a second reading at the next
meeting,.

PUBLIC COMMENT: None.

MAYOR'’S REPORT:

Mayor Wilbert thanked Councilmembers and staff for their participation in the Counci] Retreat
last Thursday, and asked if there were any issues that needed further discussion.
Councilmembers agreed that their concerns had been covered in the reireat and that no further
worksessions were necessary until staff began the budget preparation.



COUNCIL COMMENTS:

Councilmember Derek Young reported that Councilmember Owel, Councilmember Picinich, and
he were going to attend the local Business Development Meeting for the Chamber of Commerce,
Tuesday, June 2. He added that if any Councilmembers had any concems or comments, to
contact one of the three before the meeting.

Councilmember Steve Ekberg gave a short report on the Local Involvement Committee for SR-
16 project. He explained that the description of the project for the advisory election had been
drafted and that if anyone was interested in a copy, to contact the City Clerk.

STAFF REPORT:

Mitch Barker, Chief of Police. Gig Harbor Police Department. Chief Barker gave an update of
the April statistics. He invited Councilmembers to come and observe the upcoming firearms
training session on June 1% at the Sportsman Club. He added that one session runs from 1:00
p.m. to 3:00 p.m. and the second from 6:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.

ANNOUNCEMENT OF OTHER MEETINGS: None.

APPROVAL OF BILLS;

MOTION: Move approval of checks #20157 through #20277 in the amount of
$141,377.52. '
Young/Ekberg - unanimously approved.

EXECUTIVE SESSION:

MOTION: Move to adjourn to Executive Session at 7:52 p.m. for approximately 30
minutes for the purpose of discussing property acquisition per RCW
42.30.110, (b) and litigation per RCW 42.30.110 (i).
Picinich/Young - unanimously approved.

MOTION: Move to retumn to regular session at 8:20 p.m,
Picinich/Owel — unanimously approved.

ADJOURN:

MOTION: Move to adjourn at 8:20 p.m.
Platt/Owel - unanimously approved.




Cassetie recorder utilized.
Tape 496 Side B 168 —end.
Tape 497 Side A 000 - 389,

Mayor City Clerk



WHEREAS, this is the ti ' when n Organizations, Community Leaders Y
i four|vete that have made the American way
through their sacrificesfand uns¢lfish devotion to ty,«;nd

WHEREAS, our vete con!’inue td serve _@n n1

WHERIAS, over 70,000 of th
Security Department last yearjand

WHEREAS, wer ecoé ize thaf
community.

NOW THEREFORE, WE, N/
1998as

and encourage all employers, service _;__'.
service men and women.

676,000 veteransmbthe Sl.lte oi' W.wlung,ton ought rvices om the Employment

. r g, :- n this event of honor for our

Gretchen A. Wilbert, Mayor

Date
m



RECEWED

STATE OF WASHINGTON MAY 2 6 1998
EMPLOYMENT SECURITY DEPARTMENT a
May 20, 1998 GITY OF tata nAnsY
Mayor Gretchen Wilbert
City of Gig Harbor
3105 Judson St

Gig Harbor, WA 98335

Dear Mayor Wilbert,

I want to thank you for taking time out of your busy schedule to review our
request for supporting June 1998 as “Hire A Veteran Month”.

Last year, for the first time, we were able to contact over half of the Mayors
statewide who responded with proclamations or letters of support. I want to thank all of
the mayors that were able to participate in placing over 1600 veterans in jobs across the
state in the month of June.

Offices around the state work hard all yearlong helping veterans obtain
employment and V<feran services. “Hirs A Veteran Month” in June is a special time
when we pay tribute to owr veterans assund the state, for their sacrifices to make cur
country what it is today.

During the month of June special events will take place across the state for
veterans. Your support for “Hire A Veteran Month” will be greatly appreciated.

To participate in this noteworthy event please forward a copy of your completed
proclamation to our office so that a historical record can be maintained for future
reference. A draft of the Governor’s proclamation enclosed as a (sample only) you may
want to use your own, or change it and that’s ok.

Please feel free to contact me at (253) 589-7345 if you have any questlons Again,
thank you for supporting the community and our veterans.

Sincerely,
~ e ;_7;:’//
Sal Cantu, LVER .

Lakewood Job Service Center
P.O. Box 99848
Tacoma, WA 98469

h









City of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime City”

DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING & BUILDING SERVICES
3125 JUDSON STREET
GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 58335
1253) 8514278

TO: MAYOR WILBERT AND CITY COUNCIL

FROM: STEVE BOWMAN, BUILDING OFFICIAL/FIRE MARSHAL

DATE: JUNE 4, 1998

SUBJECT: ADOPTION OF THE WA. STATE BUILDING CODES WITH STATE
AND CITY REVISIONS

INTRODUCTION:

The Washington State Legislature has delegated the responsibility for revising the State Building
Codes to the Building Code Council (BCC). Revisions to the State Building Codes were
adopted by the BCC on November 14, 1957 with an effective date set for July 1, 1998.

POLICY ISSUES:

The draft ordinance before you would approve the WA State revisions to the 1997 UBC as amended
by the City of Gig Harbor Building Code Advisory Board during their meeting on May 11, 1998,
The City of Gig Harbor Building Code Advisory Board is concerned that the City of Gig Harbor
have standards that arc uniform or of a higher standard than those standards enforced in the
jurisdictions surrounding the City of Gig Harbor. This draft of the ordinance was modified to help
identify those changes to the individual 1997 editions to the Uniform Codes and the existing GHMC
by using the standard strike-out and underline format.

Proposed revisions to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code from what was previously adopted by
the City Council:

1. PAGE 2 Appendix 29 UBC is adopted to correspond to WA State Amendment to

restroom fixture schedule.

PAGE 3 Building permits required for signs

PAGE 4 Definition of those signs that would be exempt from building permits

PAGE 10 Adoption of the UPC installation standards — Appendix I

PAGE 13 Adoption of the UMC installation standards — Appendix A

PAGE 16 Adoption of UFC Appendix HI-A on Hazardous Fire Areas

PAGE 16 Adoption of UFC Appendix IV-A on Interior Floor Finishes

PAGE 16 Adoption of UFC Appendix IV-B on Christmas Trees

PAGE 16 Requiring E-1 Occupancies (Schools with S0+ children) to have auto-fire

spnnlder systems. Washington State BCC has adopted an exception (WAC 51-44-1003) to the 1997

UBC which deletes the requirement that auto-fire sprinkler systems must be installed in ex1stmg

buildings that are converted to an E-1 Occupancy.

10. PAGE 25 Deletion of Section 15.12.080(A)4) of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is

proposed by the BCAB. This section is peculiar to the City of Gig Harbor and requires a higher fire
WGH_SRVI'VOLINUSERS\PLANNING\STEVE\ORD-RES\CCMO972.UBC. doc

(O mNo e



10. PAGE25  Deletion of Section 15.12.080(A)4) of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is
proposed by the BCAB, This section is peculiar fo the City of Gig Harbor and requires a higher fire

safety for building construction and/or fire flow than what is provided in other jurisdictions. This
section does not allow the use of auto-fire sprinkler systems to reduce the required fire flow when
auto-fire sprinkler systems are required due to a particular requirement within the Uniform Building
Code. A higher fire resistive construction, the use of additional fire walls and a higher fire flow all
have been required to allow the construction of buildings under the administration of this section.
11. PAGE 30 Clarifying the interpretation of Appendix HI-B UFC for fire hydrant spacing.
12. PAGE 35 Clarifying the requirement that all existing hotels and motels must have auto
fire sprinkler systems installed within 5 years after the effective date of this ordinance or the
effective date of annexation.

The City Attorney has reviewed this draft of the adopting ordinance and modifications have been
completed to address the City Attorney’s recommendations.

RECOMMENDATION:

The Mayor and City Council adopt the 1997 Uniform Building Codes with the revisions as
adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council and as recommended by the Gig Harbor
Building Code Advisory Board, after the second reading of the ordinance and inclusion of any
required revisions.

WGH_SRVIWOLINUSERSWPLANNINGS TEVEVORD-RESNCCMO972.UBC dac



CITY OF GIG HARBOR
ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON, ADCOPTING THE
WASHINGTON STATE BUILDING CODE, including the 1997 editions to the Uniform
Building Code, Including Appendix 29, Uniform Fire Code, Including Appendix II-A, IV-A,
IV-B, Uniform Plumbing Code, Including Appendix I, Uniform Mechanical Code, Including
Appendix A, Uniform Code For the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, and the Amendments
to These Codes in the Washington Administrative Code (Chapters 51-11, 51-13, 51-19, 51-20,
51-40, 51-42, 51-44 and 51-45 with the exception of WAC 51-44-0980 and 51-44-1003.2.4.1),
Allowing Any Person to Request an Interpretation of the Building Code From the Board of
Appeals, Requiring Building Permits For Installation of Signs, Specifically Defining Those
Signs Exempt From Building Permit Requirements, Requiring E-1 Occupancies to Have Auto-
Fire Sprinkler Systems, Requiring a Higher Fire Resistive Construction, the Use of Additional
Fire Walls and a Higher Fire Flow For New or Substantially Remodeled Buildings, Clarifying
The Interpretation of Appendix III-B to the UFC For Fire Hydrant Spacing, Clarifying the
Requirement That All Existing Hotels and Motels have Auto Fire Sprinkler Systems Installed
Within Five Years After the Effective Date of This Ordinance or the Effective Annexation
Date; Repealing Chapters 15.06, 15.08, 15.10, 15.12, and 15.32; Adding New Chapters 15.06,
15.08, 15.10, 15.12, and 15.32 and Amending Sections 15.18.002 and 15.02.010 of the Gig
Harbor Municipal Code, and Providing an Effective date, o,
WHEREAS, the Washington State Legislature has adopted the 1997 editions to the Uniform
Building, Fire, Plumbing, Mechanical Codes, together with certain Washington Administrative Code
{("WAC") amendments Codes and uniform code standards and amended the Washington State
Energy and Ventilation; and,

WHEREAS, the Codes as amended will become effective in all cities and counties in the State of
Washington on July 1, 1998; and,

WHEREAS, the Gig Harbor Municipal Code must be amended to reflect the adoption of the new
regulations; and,

WHEREAS, the Gig Harbor City Council finds that the adoption of the 1997 Uniform Building
Codes with certain Washington State Building Code amendments is in the public interest.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR,
WASHINGTON, ORDAINS AS FOLLOWS:

PASTEVEORD RESWIUBCORD.DOC -1-




Section 1. Section 15.026.010(A4) of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is amended

to read as follows:

15.02.010 Building Code Advisory Board

A,

There js cre a build; e adviso d to:

* O ¥
4. Provide reasonable interpretations of the building codes and GHMC Title

Section 2. Chapter 15.06 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 3. A new chapter 15.06 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code,

to read as follows:

Sections:
15.06.010
15.06.015

15.06.020
15.06.030
15.06.040
15.06.041
15.06.042
15.06.050
15.06.060
15.06.070
15.06.080
15.06.090
15.06.100

Chapter 15.06
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE

Uniform Building Code adopted.

Building permits and other permits exempt from SEPA are excluded from
project permit processing in GHMC Title 19 J
Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings adopted
Historic Building Code adopted.

Appeals - Hearing examiner/building code advisory board.
Amendment to Section 106.1, Uniform Building Code.
Amendment to Section 106.2, Uniform Building Code.

Complete Permit Application.

Expiration.

Permit fees.

Amendment to Section 310.10, Uniform Building Code.
Amendment to Section 904.2.8, Uniform Building Code.
Amendment to Section 1006.3, Uniform Building Code.

15.06.010 Uniform Building Code Adopted. The Uniform Building Code, 1997 Edition,
including Appendix Chapters 15, 29 and 33, and the Uniform Building Code Standards, 1997
Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, and as amended by the
State of Washington as Chapter 51-40 Washington Administrative Code, are adopted for use within
the City of Gig Harbor.

15.06.015 Exclusions from Project Permit Processing n GHMC Title 19,

FAUSERSWPLANNINGASTEYE\ORD-RESWIVBCORD DAC = 2 -



Pursuant to RCW 36.70B.140(2), building permits, other construction permits or similar
administrative approvals which are categorically exempt from environmental review under the State
Environmental Policy Act (Chapter 43.21C RCW) and GHMC Title 18 (SEPA), or
permits/approvals for which environmental review has been completed in connection with other
project permits under GHMC Title 19, are excluded from the following procedures:

A. Notice of Application (GHMC 19.02.004);

B. Except as provided above, optional consolidated project permit review processing

(GHMC 19.02.002(B);
C. Joint public hearings (GHMC 19.01.004);

15.06.020 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Adopted. The Uniform
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, published by the International
Conference of Building Officials, is adopted for use within the City of Gig Harbor.

15.06.030 Historic Building Code Adopted. The Historic Building Code, Chapter 51-19
WAC, is adopted for use within the City of Gig Harbor.

15.06.040 Amendment to Section 105.1, Uniform Building Code. Section 105.1 of the
Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

eopy-to-the building-official: The Gig Harbor Building Code Advisory Board

T ter 15.02 hall i I alsg
inistrative determinati t decisions of the buildi ial

view new standard rdinance revisi ithi itle

15.06.041 Amendment to Section 106.1, Uniform Building Code. Section 106.1 of
the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

Permits Required. Except as specified in Section 106.2, no building or
structure regulated by this code shall be erected, constructed, enlarged, altered,

WGH_SRV IWOLRUSERS\PLANNING'S TEVE\ORD-RESWIUBCORD.DOC - 3 -




repaired, moved, improved, removed, converted or demolished unless a
separate permit for each building or structure has first been obtained from the
building official. ildi it shall also be required for the installats
or structural modification of a sign which will be attached to a building or be
self supporting with the f the sign over thirty six inches above grade. The
obtaining of a buildin it for intstal atlo structural modlfjganon of

15.06.042 Amendment to Section 106.2, Uniform Building Code. Section 106.2 of
the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

106.2 Work Exempt from Permit. A building permit shall not be required for the
following:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used a s tool and storage sheds,
playhouses, and similar uses, provide the floor area does not exceed 120
square feet (11.15 m).

2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.

3. Oil dernicks.

4, Movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (1753 mm)
high.

5. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm in height measured from
the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a
surcharge or impounding Class I, II or IIT-A liquids.

6. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not excced
5,000 gallons (18,927 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width does
not exceed 2:1.

7. Platforms, walks and driveways not more that 30 inches (762 mm) above
grade and not over any basement or story below.

8. Painting, papering and similar finish work.

9. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

10. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R, Division 3,
and Group U Occupancies when projecting not more that 45 inches (1372
min).

11. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R, Division 3
QOccupancy in which the pool walls are entirely above the adjacent grade
and if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,927 L).

12, All m; ug! mggs, ﬂags, penn@];s, gt; gmgm, b@gﬂ, ai!mns, mﬂ table

uildi I NOn- trucrural mo 1cat1o ' 1 sign. Thi

exception does not exempt the applicant from Qb;gggmg the necessary sign
permit,

WEH_SEVIWOL NUSERS\WLANNIMGAS TEVE QRD-RESNS TRCORD. DOC - 4 -



Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing, electrical and mechanical
permits will be required for the above-exempted items.

Exemption from the permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to
grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the
provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

15.06.050 Amendment to Section 106.3.1, Uniform Building Code. Section 106.3.1
of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

106.3.1 Application. A vali mplete building permit applicaf;
c hat is permitted un i other land use control ordi
effect on the date of the application shall be considered under Title 15 of the Cig
at] nicipal Code in e i application and the zonin
e contro! ordinances | of application. To obtain a permit,

the applicant shall first file an application therefor in writing on a form furnished by
the sede-enforeement-agensy City for that purpose. Every such application for any

roject costi 0 ve t shall:

1. Identify and describe the work to be covered by the permit for
which application is made;

2. Describe the land on which the proposed work is to be done

by legal description, street address, tax parcel number or
similar description that will readily identify and definitely
locate the proposed building or work;

3. Indicate the use or occupancy for which the proposed work is
intended;

4, Be accompanied by plans, diagrams, computations and
specifications and other data as required in Section 106.3.2;

5. State the valuation of any new building or structure or any
addition, remodeling or alteration to an existing building;

6. Be signed by the applicant, or the applicant's authorized agent;

7. Give-such-other-date-andinformationasmav-bateanired-k
phone number;

WOH_SRY IWOLIWSERSIPLANNING STEVE\QRD-RESWTURCORD. BOC - 5 -



8. The prime contractor's business name, address, phone number,
current state contractor registration number;

9. . Either:

a. the name, address and phone number of the office of
the lender administering the interim construction

financing, if any, or
b, the name and address of the fj hat liag 1ssued
ayment _bond, if any. on f of rime
contractor for the protection of the owner;, if the bond
isforana tnot 1 % of unt

of the construction project.

10. Any information required to demonstrate compliance with the
State Environmental Policy Act, as adopted by the City under

Titl

11. vidence of an ate water s or the intended use of
h tlcdi uired W 19.27.09

B.  The information required on the application by subsections A(1).
AQ) A, AR), and A(9) of this section shall be set forth on the

ildi i which is | the ow t
ingpection record ¢ ich shall at the truction site.

C. el 10 uire oty

D. the information required by subsectio of this section

is not available at the time the application is submitted, the applicant
shall so state and the application shall be processed forthwith and the
permit issued as if the information had been supplied, and the lack of
the information shall not caunse the application to be deemed complete
for the purposes of vesting. However, the applicant shall provide the

remaining information as socon as the applicant ¢an reasonabiy obtain
such information.

WGH_SRY WOLNUSERS\WPEANNENGIETEY EVORD-RESWTLIBCORD. DOC - 6 -



15.06.060. Amendment to Section 106.4.4, Uniform Building Code. Section
106.4.4 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

106.4.4 Expiration,

Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions of this code
shall expire by limitation and become null and void if:_(1) the building or
work authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 days from the
date of such permit; (2) exif the building or work authorized by such permit
is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a

period of 180 days; or (3) if the building or work authorized by such permit

has not been completed, a final inspection has not been given and a certificate
{ AT i ithi om the date of such permit.

Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained
to do 50, and the fee therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new
permit for such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made
in the original plans and specifications for such work, and provided further
than such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. In order
to renew action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full
permit fee.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of the
time within which work may commence under that permit when the permittee
is unable to commence work within the time required by this section for good
and satisfactory reasons. The building official may extend the time for action
by the permittee for a period not exceeding 180 days on written request by
the permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee
have prevented action from bemg taken. No pern:ut shall be extended more

| shall pay a ngw full permit fee.

15.06.070 Amendment to Section 107.2, Uniform Building Code.
Section 107.2 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

107.2 Permit Fees.

A fee for each permit shall be nalsl_to_the_Cnmﬂ'hg.HaLb.Qun_the_amenm
set forth in Table 1-A and_as

Municipal Code,

The determination of value or valuation under any of the provisions of this

code shall be made by the building official, who shall use the most current

WGH_SRYIWOLNSERS\PLANNINGSTEVEYORD-RESSTUBCORD.DOC - 7 -




publication of the Building Valuation Work sheet, which is based upon data

compiled by the atio nce of Buildin ials and published
in_the Buildi tan nilding cost reference. Said_building
valuation Work sheet shall be posted in the City Building Department of
Planning and Building. The value to be used in computing the building

permit and building plan review fees shall be the total value of all
construction work for which the permit is issued, as well as all finish work,
painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, elevators,
fire-extinguishing systems and any other permanent equipment.

15.06.080 Amendment to Section 310,10, Uniform Building Code. Section
310.10 of the Uniform Building Code 1s amended as follows:

310.10 Fire Alarm Systems.

Group R, Division 1 Occupancies shall be provided with a manual and
antomatic fire alarm system in apartment houses three or more stories in

height, or two or more stones in height with a basement, or containing +6-e¢
more than five (5) dwelling units, #n-hotels-three-ormore-storiesin-height-or
containing 20-or-rore-guestreoms and every hotel and motel which contains

six (6) or more guest rooms and in congregate residences three or more
stories in height or having an occupant load of 20 or more. A fire alarm and

commnunication system shall be provided in Group R, Division 1 Occupancies
located in a high-rise building,.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A manual fire alarm system need not be provided in buildings
not over two stories in height when all individual dwelling
units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from
each other and public or common areas by at least one-hour
fire-resistive occupancy separations and each individual
dwelling unit or guest room has an exit directly to a public

way, exit court or yard, exterior stairway or exterjor exit
balcony. -

2. A separate fire alarm system need not be provided in
buildings that are protected throughout by an approved
supervised fire sprinkler having a local alarm to notify all
occupants,

The alarm signal shall be a distinctive sound that is not used for any other
purpose other than the fire alarm. Alarm-signaling devices shall produce a

WIH_SRVIYWOL NUSERSWPLANNINGS TEVEWRDL-RESWTUBCORD.DOC - 8 -



sound that exceeds the prevailing equivalent sound level in the room or space
by 15 decibels minimum, or exceeds any maximum sound level with a
duration of 30 seconds minimum by 5 decibels minimum, whichever is
louder. Sound levels for alarm signals shall be 120 decibels maximum.

For the purposes of this section, area separation walls shall not define

separate buildings.

see Secti 11 he Gig Harbor Municipal Code which i

£ Gig Har m tion 1007.2.8.2 Uniform Fire e T
installatio irements j isti R QOccupancies.

15.06.090 Amendment to Section 904.2.9, Uniform Building Code. Section
904.2.9 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

904.2.9 Gronp R, Division 1 Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed throughout every apartmenthouse building classifi
Divisi which exceeds § 8 ¢ feet or exce

three-or-mere-stortes-ir-height two (2) stories in height or containing 46 5 or

more dwelling units, every congregate residence three or more stories in
hmght or havmg an occupant load of Q-O—ef more than 10 and every hotel

Remdentlal or qulck—response standard spnt‘lklers shall be used in the
dwelling units the entire me; r

Mhﬂmmm&@ and guest room portions of the building.

For the purpose of this Section, area separation walls shall not define separate
buildings.

15.06.100 Amendment to Section 1003.3.3.3, Uniform Building Code as
Amended by the State of Washington Building Code Council. Section 1003.3.3.3
of the Uniform Building Code, is amended as follows:

1003.3.3.3 Rise and Run.

A The rise of steps and stairs shall not be less than 4 inches (102 mm)

nor more than FH2-inches(198mn)_ 7 inches (178 mm). The

greatest riser height within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the
smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5mm). Except as permitted in
Sections 1003.3.3.8.1, 1003.3.3.8.2 and 1003.3.3.8.3, the run shall not

be less than +0-inches{254-mm) 11 inches (279 mm), as measured
horizontally between the vertical planes of the furthermost

WGH_SRVIWVOL BUSERSPLANNING'STEVEVORD-RESSTUBCORD. DOC - 9 -




Section 4. Chapter 15.08 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 5. A new chapter 15.08 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code,

to read as follows:

Sections:
15.08.010
15.08.020
15.08.030
15.08.040
15.08.050

projections of adjacent treads or nosings. Stair treads shall be of
uniform size and shape, except the largest tread run within any flight
of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5

mm).
EXCEPTIONS:

1. Private steps and stairways serving an occupant load of less
than 10 and stairways to unoccupied roofs may be constructed
with an 8-inch-maximum (203 mm) rise and a 9-inch-
minimum (229 mm) run.

2. Where the bottom or top riser adjoins a sloping public way, walk or
driveway having an established grade and serving as a landing, the

bottom or top riser may be reduced along the slope.

3. teps alrwa ing three and four family dwellings may be

constructed with a 7 1/2 inches (190 mm) rise and a 10 inches (254

min) rug.

Where Exception 2 to Section 1103.2.2 1s used in a building design,
the run of stair treads shall not be less than 11 inches (279 mm), as
measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the furthermost,
projections of adjacent tread. - The largest tread within any flight of
stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (3.5 mm).

Chapter 15.08
UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

Provisions adopted.

Violations and Penalties

Expiration.

Appeals ~ Hearing examiner/building code advisory board.
Building Official — Administrative Authority

WOH_SRYIWOLNUSERS\PLANNING'STEVEWORD-RES\WTUBCORD. DOC - ].0 -



15.08.010 Provisions Adopted. The Uniform Plumbing Code, 1997 Edition,
including Appendix Chapters A, B, D, H and I, published by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials and as amended by the
Washington State Building Code Council as Chapters 51-46 and 51-47 WAC are
adopted by reference for use within the city of Gig Harbor,

15.08.020 Amendment to Section 102.3, Violations and Penalties. Seétion
102.3 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as follows:

102.3 Violations and Penalties.
102.3.1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect,
construct, Enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip,
use, or maintain any plumbing or permit the same to be done in violation of this
Code.

102.3.2 Penalties.

1 he Gig Harbor M 'ci

15.08.030 Amendment to Section 103.3.4, Uniform Plumbing Code. Section
103.3.4 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as follows:

103.3.4 Expiration. Every permit issued by the Administrative-Antherity
building official under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation

and become null and void under any of the following circurnstances: (1) if the
work authorized by such permit is not commenced within one hundred eighty

(180) days from the date of such permit; (2) or if the work authorized by such
permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced

fora penod of one hundred elghty (180) days, L&)_Qﬂﬁhmgx;k_amhgnzc_d
h 1 1 ) £ [JE i 3

work can be recommenced anew penmt shall be ﬁrst obtamed to do so, and
the fee therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new permit for
such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the
original plans and specifications for such work, and provided further, than
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. In order to
renew action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full
permit fee.

WGH_SRV INVOL WUSERS\PLANNING'S TEVE\ORD- RESWTUBCORD DOC -11-



Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of
the time within which work may commence under that perrait when the
permitee is unable to commence work within the time required by this section
for good and satisfactory reasons. The Administrative-Authority building
official may extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not
exceeding one hundred eighty (180) days upon written request by the
permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee
have prevented action from being taken. No permit shall be extended more
than once. In order to renew action on a permit after expiration, the permiftee
shall pay a new full permit fee.

15.08.40 A New Section 104 to the Uniform Plumbing Code. A new Section
15.08.040 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code, to read as follows:

Section 104 APPEALS. Requests for interpretations, appeals of

administrativ rminations. o decisions of the buildin icial
shall be heard the Buildi e Advisory Board pursuant to chapter
15.02 GHMC.

15.08.050 Amendment to Section 203.0 ¢o the Uniform Plumbing Code. Section
203.0 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as follows:

Section 203.0 -A- ;

ABS — Acrylonitrile-Butadiene-Styrene.

Accessible — When applied to a fixture, connection, appliance, or equipment,
“accessible” means having access thereto, but which first may require the removal
of an access panel, door, or similar obstruction. “Readily accessible” means direct
access without the necessity of removing any panel, door, or similar obstruction.

Admmlstlatwe Authorlty The glty oi ﬁlg Hazbor bulldmg official -mdw*d&al

e ThJs deﬁmtlon sha.ll mclude
the Adiﬁiﬁmwe-&&ﬁieﬂﬂ'—s QLtLQ_f_GJ.g_H_bm’_thd_g_Qfﬁg al’s duly authorized

representative.
Airbreak - A physical separation which may be a low inlet into the indirect waste

receptor from the fixture, appliance, or device indirectly connected.

Air Chamber — A pressure surge-absorbing device operating through the
compressibility of air.

Airgap, Drainage — The unobstructed vertical distance through the free atmosphere
between the lowest opening from any pipe, plumbing fixture, appliance or
appurtenance ¢onveying waste to the flood level rim of the receptor.

NGH_SRV 1WWOL INUSERSWLANNINGSTEVE\ORD- RESSTUBCORD.DOC -12-



Airgap, Water Distribution — The unobstructed vertical distance through the fee
atmosphere between the lowest opening from any pipe or faucet conveying potable
water to the flood level rim of any tank, vat or fixture.

Anchors — See Supports.

Approved — Accepted or acceptable under an applicable specification or standard
stated or cited in this Code, or accepted as suitable for the proposed use under
procedures and authority of the Administrative Authority.

Approved Testing Agency — An organization primarily established for purposes of
testing to approved standards and approved by the Administrative Authority,

Area Drain ~ A receptacle designed to collect surface or storm water from an open
area.

Aspirator — A fitting or device supplied with water or other fluid under positive
pressure which passes through an integral orifice or constriction, causing a vacuum.

Section 6. Chapter 15.10 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 7. A new chapter 15.10 1s hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code,

to read as follows:

Sections:

Chapter 15.10
UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE

15.10.010 Provisions adopted.

15.10.020 Appeals - Hearing examiner/building code advisory board.
15.10.030 Expiration.

15.10.040 Building Official — Administrative Authority

15.10.010 Provisions adopted. The Uniform Mechanical Code, 1997 Edition,
including Appendix A, published by the Intemational Conference of Building
Officials, as amended by the Washington State Building Code Council in Chapter
51-42 WAC, is adopted for use within the City of Gig Harbor,

15.10.020 Amendment to Section 110.1, Uniform Mechanical Code. Section

110.1 of the Uniform Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

..... = SVCRL W LR - =

Section 110.1

S

- BO

-y

ARD OF APPEALS. Inorderto-hear-and deeide

WGH_SRVIWOLUSERSWLANNINGSTEVEORD-RESWIUBOORD. DOC -13 -




15.10.030 Amendment to Section 114.4.1, Uniform Mechanical Code. Section
114.4.1 of the Uniform Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

114.4.1 Expiration. Every permit issued by the Administrative-Authority
building official under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation
and become null and void under any of the following circumstances: (1) if the
work authorized by such permit is not commenced within one hundred eighty
(180) days from the date of such permit; (2) or if the work authorized by such
permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced
for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days; (3) or if the work authorized
hy_such permit has not !,1 n ngplgted and a final 1n§pect10n and approval

has not been given wi om the date of such . Before such
work can be recommenced, a new permit shail be first obtained to do so, and
the fee therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new permit for
such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the
original plans and specifications for such work, and provided further, than
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. In order to
renew action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full
permit fee.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of
the time within which work may commence under that permit when the
permitee is unable to commence work within the time required by this section

for good and satisfactory reasons. The Administrative-Autherity building

official may extend the time for action by the permittee for a peried not

exceeding one hundred eighty (180) days upon written request by the
permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permiitee

have prevented action from being taken. No permit shall be extended more

an once. rder to renew action on a permit iration, the permittee

hall a new full it fe

WEH_SRY (WOL WSERIPLANNING STEVERD-RESSTUBCORD. DG - 14 -



15.10.040  Amendment to Section 203.0 to the Uniform Mechanical Code.
Section 203.0 of the Uniform Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

Section 203.9 _ -A-

ABSORPTION UNIT is an absorption refrigeration system which has been factory
—assembled and tested prior to its installation

ACCESSIBLE means having access to but which first may require the removal of
an access panel, door or similar obstruction covering the item described.
ACCESSIBLE, READILY means capable of being reached safely and quickly for
operation, repair or inspection without requiring those to whoom ready access is
requisite to climb over or remove obstacles, or to resort to the use of portable access
equipment.

Administrative Authority is the city of Gig Harbor building gfﬁcial—i—neli#idaa—k
e . .

Oyt ~ t-HHH RO e oOy—d 2 &0

. Boda—aepha e h D-dHE H nyis = HH Y
¥ E ] £ 3 E

mclude the Adm}msmmna—ﬁﬁt-heﬂhf—s ggy ig”;gg arbor bmldmg official’s duly

authorized representative.

AIR, COMBUSTION. See COMBUSTION AIR

AIR, CONDITIONED is air which has been treated to achieve a desired level of
temperature, humidity or cleanliness.

AIR-HANDLING UNIT is a blower or fan used for the purpose of distributing
supply air to a room, space or area.

AIR, MAKEUP is air which is provided to replace air being exhuasted.
AIR-MOVING SYSTEM is a system designed to provide heating, cooling or
ventilation in which one or more air-handling units are used to supply air to a
common space or are drawing air from a common plenum or space.

AJR, OUTSIDE is air from outside the building intentionally conveyed by openings
or ducts to rooms or to conditioning equipment.

AIR, RETURN is air from the conditioned area that is returned to the conditioning
equipment for reconditioning.

AIR, SUPPLY is air being conveyed to a conditioned area through ducts or plenums
from a heat exchanger of a heating, cooling, absorption or evaporative cooling
systems. '

- APPLIANCE is a device which utilizes fuel or other forms of energy to produce

light, heat, power, refrigeration or air conditioning. This definition also shall include
a vented decorative appliance.
APPROVED, as to materials, equipment and method of construction, refers to
approval by the Administrative Authority as the result of investigation and tests by
the Administrative Authority, or by reason of accepted principles or tests by national
authorities, technical or scientific organizations.

WGH_SRYHYOLISERS\PLANNING'STEVEORD-RESWIUBCORD. DOC - 15 -




APPROVED AGENCY is an established and recognized agency regularly engaged
in conducting tests or fumishing inspection services, when such agency has been
approved by the Administrative Authority.

ASSEMBLY BUILDING is a building or a portion of a building used for the
gathering together of 50 or more persons for such purposes as deliberation,
education, instruction, worship, entertainment, amusement, drinking, dining, or
awaiting transportation.

AZEOTROPE is a refrigerant blend comprising multiple components of different
volatiles that, when used in refrigeration cycles, do not change volumetric
composition or saturation temperature as they evaporate.

Section 8. Chapter 15.12 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 9. A new chapter 15. 12is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code,
to read as follows:

Chapter 15.12
UNIFORM FIRE CODE

Sections:

15.12.010 Provisions adopted.

15.12.020 Amendment to Section 103.1.4, Appeals.

15.12.030 Amendment to Section 104.2, Investigations. ;

15.12.040 Amendment to Article 2, Definitions — Additional.

15.12.041 Amendment to Article 2, Definitions — Chief.

15.12.042 Amendment to Article 2, Definitions — Fire Department.

15.12.050 Amendment to Section 901.4.2, Fire apparatus access.

15.12.060 Amendment to Section 302.2.2.1, Fire apparatus access dimensions.

15.12.070 Amendment to Section 902.2.2.3, Turning Radius

15.12.080 Amendment to Section 903.3, Type of water supply.

15.12.090 Amendment to Section 903.4.2, Required installations.

15.12.100 Amendment to Sections 1003.2.9, Fire sprinkler systems, Group R, Div. 1.

15.12.110 Amendment to Section 1007.2.9.1.1, Fire Alarm Systems.

15.12,111 Amendment to Section 1007.2.9.2, Fire Alarm Systems. Existing Buildings.

15.12.120 Establishment of limited in districts for storage of compressed natural gas.

15.12.130  Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of explosives and blasting
agents is to be prohibited.

15.12.140 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of flammable or
combustible liquids in outside aboveground tanks is to be prohibited.

15.12.150 Establishment of limits in which bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas 1s
to be restricted.

15.12.151 Establishment of limits in which bulk storage of stationary tanks of flammable
cryogenic fluids are prohibited.

WGH_SRVIWOL WSERS\WLANNING'S TE VEVIRD-RESSTUBCORD.DOC = 16 -



15.12.152
15.12.160
15.12.170
15.12.180

15.12.015

Establishment of limits in which storage of hazardous materials is to be
prohibited or limited.

Amendments to Section 8504, Abatement of Electrical Hazards.
Amendments to Appendix III-C, Testing Personnel

Amendment to Section 6.3, Appendix II-C, Pier Fire Flow.

Proviéions adopted. The Uniform Fire Code, 1997 Edition,

including Appendix Chapters I-A, 1I-A, 11I-C, II-D, II-E, [I-F, JII-A, I[II-B, III-C, IV-
A, IV-B, V-A and VI-A, and the Uniform Fire Code Standards, published by the
International Conference of Building Officials and the Western Fire Chiefs'
Association, as amended by the Washington State Building Code Coungil in Chapter
51-44 and 51-45 of the WAC, with the exception of WAC 51-44-0900 and 51-44-
1003.2.4.1, are adopted for use within the City of Gig Harbor.

15.12.020

Amendment to Section 103.1.4, Uniform Fire Code. Section

103.1.4 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Bo hall ] ive fo int of the administrative
rovisions hi 1 th empowered waive
. fihi !
15.12.030 Amendment to Section 104.2, Uniform Fire Code. Section 104.2

of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

104.2 Investigations. The fire-department Fire Chief of Pierce County Fire

District No. 5 or his/her designee ts authorized to investigate promptly the
cause, ongm and c1rcumstanccs of each and every ﬁre eeeumng—m—ﬂae

T

VGH_SRY 1WOLINUSERS\PLANNING'S TEVE\ORD-RESW7UBCURD. DOC -17-




eila]rl-phya
indjcates that the cause of the fire is determined to be suspicious or criminal

in nature, the Fire Chief of Pierce County Fire District No. 5 or his/her

designee shall immediately report the results of the investigation to the Police
Chief and L

f the ington State Patrol, t ihe st
marshal .

The ehief Fire Chief of Pierce County Fire District No. 5 or his/her designee

is authorized to investigate the cause, origin and circumstances of
unauthorized releases of hazardous materials.

The City of Gig Harbor police department is authorized to assist the fire
department in its investigation when requested to do so.

15.12.040 Amendment to Article 2, Uniform Fire Code. Section Article 2 of
the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

The following are additio efinitions and abbreviatio those found in

Article 2 of the Uniform Fire Code:
1 "AWWA'" means the American Water Works Association. ;

2. "Buildin ation data" means i and. nthl
publication issued by the Intermational Conference of Building
Qfficials,

3. E_Qmmgrmal a,[g_a_ﬁ _mga,ns ;my development with bulldmgs other

dw ions in_th
mxgmretgngn QI thig definiti 1 on, conceming whether a development
is ct erci v eference to the occupancy tables

4, "Cag in the Unt Fire
mneans cl

2

6.

i £ No estlc wat

WGH_SRYIWVOLINUSERS PLANNINGSTEVE\ORD-RESS7UBCORD DOC -18 -



f

whi is - .. s tln dﬁmlnf lowst

Drowde water &Qmme_to_mldmgnal_s_ems_e_c_qmgﬂLx
_mmm&m&mmmm s1zed to meet the

xpandlgg sys_tgm shall show bv Dlans submltted bv a reglstered
rof nomeer how fire flow, if 1rdlstobe rovide

the roved by the Harbor publi
departme i Harbor fire marshal.

8.

9,

10.

11.
the ﬁredepg,;tr_n ent.

12 "Industrial area” means manufacturing operations condycted ip
buildi ventional design suitable for various &
manufacture.

13.  Inspector” of the fire department, or bureau of fire prevention, means

rsonnel desi and_assiened to perform the fire in
functions by the fire marshal of Gig Harbor,

14. "Office of fire prevention and arson control.”" as used in the Uniform
i ode a mended in this chapter means that o
coenized ity fire marshal to be ahl erf

nece i f arson control.
15.
16,

WGH_SRVIWOLNUSERS\PLANNINGS TEVEVORD-RESWIUBCORD. DOC - ].9 -




usg for the purpose. The location is such that it is accessible for

immediate use of the fire department for all nearby property.

17. "Standby firemen,” "fire watch,” and "fire guard," as used in the

Uniform Fire Code and as amended in this chapter mneans one or

m xperienced i he her gualifj TSOn requir

,g.mm n; Also see S tion 2501.19 of the Uniform E;u:e Code,

18.  "Substantial alteyation" is alteratj ere th al ¢ f all
includi limited t ical hanic
-IMO h eriod amounts QJ pe ore . h d
value.

19. "ransmission main" means a main used to fransport water from a
source to storage, source iQ source, source or storage to water main.

20, "Water authonty" and " eyor” i ublic_works
_dg;p ment, a water district, or other body Iggg! v supplying water In
nd aj ved by the city.
21, "Wat r main” means the piping used to deliver domestic water and
water inten or fire protection

15.12.041 Amendment to Section 204 - C, Uniform Fire Code. Section
Article 204 - C of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

CHIEF is the mgwf_ﬁlgﬂaanLEch_Mamhalehieﬁefﬁeef of the city
ng Sre-departnent

servmg the _]unsdlctlon or the chlef oﬂicer s authorized
representative. Except:
a Where reference is made to the investigation of cause, origin

Mﬁmﬂf_uhgnzc_d_mascs_o_hmg_
erial chief shall be ief & nty Fire

istrict

WGH_SRY IWVOLHUSERSWLANNINGS T EVESORD-RESWTUBCORD.DOC - 20 -



b. Where reference is. made to the investigation of cause, origin

and circumstances o every fire occurring in the

of Gi 1 icious or criminal in
 natur i i ierce nty Fire

District No. 5.

CHIEF ENGINEER is the chief.

CHIEF OF POLICE or POLICE DEPARTMENT is the chieflaw
enforecement- officer gity of Gig Harbor Police Chief of-the
jurisdiction or the ehieflaw-enforcementofficer’s city of Gig Harbor
Police Chief’s authorized representative. CHIEF OF THE
BUREAU OF FIRE PREVENTION is the—head-of the-fire

preven&eﬁ—bﬂfea& ity of Gig Harbor Fire Marshal. Except:
Where reference is made to the investigation of cause, origin

and circumstances of unauthorized releases of hazardous
materials, the chief shall be the chief of Pierce County Fire

District No. 5.
b. Where reference is made to the investigation of cause, origin
and circumstances of each and every fire occurring in the City
i ri ving_ 1 fi ini
cti teri he chief sha
¢ chi i i istrict No. 5.

15.12.042 Amendment to Section 207 - F, Uniform Fire Code. Section
Article 207 - F of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

FIRE DEPARTMENT is a—regul&r-bhefgaﬂﬂed—ﬁf&depamnen%ﬁe

& nt shall be Pierce ire District

\WGH_SRVI\VOL [WSERS\PLANNING\STEVEAORD-RES\STUBCORD.DOC -21-



15.12.050 Amendment to Section 901.4.2 Uniform Fire Code. Section
9011 .4.2 of the niform Fire Code is amended as follows:
Section 901.4.2 - Fire apparatus access roads. When required by the ehief

city of Gig Harbor Fire Marshal, approved signs or other approved notices

shall be provided and maintained for fire apparatus access roads to identify
such roads and prohibit the obstruction thereof or both,

vate f'the a ing systern of the City,
ghg! be g,[kg with road mgns onstructed and installed in accordance with
Gig Harbor City Road Standards.

Costs of signs ir installation shall be the responsibility of the property
owner and/or developer.

15.12.060 Amendment to Section 902.2.2.1, Uniform Fire Code. Section
902.2.2.1 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

902.2.2.1 Dimensions.

Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less thap
20 feet (6096 mm) and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13
feet 6 inches (4115 mm).

The minimum cleared vehicular roadway, driveway, or street, width shall be
twelve (12) (3658 mm) feet from shoulder to shoulder for one single family
residence. The minimum eleared vehicular roadway, driveway, or strest,
width shall be fifteen (15) (4572 mm) fe Lf[gm §bQLl|d§:IQ sbmﬂd:r_fg[_qng

way traffic, ai twent -fo 24) feet

for two-way traffl evelo ents
residence.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Private roadways which serve less than 10 living units may be
twenty (20) feet (6096 mm) in width from shoulder to

Ider fi 0 hen the roadway serves onl
R-1 or R- les as defined i if Buildin
i ite improvements comply with
the i ds section of the cu ifo
Fire e

WGH_SRV IWOL IWISERS'PLANNING\STEVEIORD- RES\WIUBCORD.DOC -22 -



2. Upon approval by the fire marshal, ml_gm:ammy_b_

red vi h red c ion es not i ess b
ndlcagng :11 513,};: Izsh@ vgrtlcgl clearancg %en—&ppfeved
3. Th fi tect] h re ulred fire
the indic. e ctlon features
would provide an equivalent fire protection to that which would be
Mgdhaﬂ_ﬂl_e_mu_ﬁmpp_mlms be provided in accordance
with thi and letter stating the ed method of
fire protecti all i to the fire marshal and fire
ent. e fire artment must indicate approval of the
ropos 0 ion or an alte ethod to that
osed bef: he fir approve the alternate method
of fire protection.

Vertical clearances or widths shall be increased when, in the opinion of the ehief the

city of Gig Harbor fire marshal, vertical clearances or widths are not adequate to

provide fire apparatus access.

15.12.070 Amendment to Section 902.2.2.3, Uniform Fire Code. Section
902.2.2.3 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

902.2.2.3 Turning Radius. The turning radius of a fire apparatus access

road shall be as approved by the city fire marshal. A minimum outside
s -five (45) feet and 2 mini inside furning radius of

twenty (20} feet shall be provided for lanes, streets, driveways, and

={e- 8.

15.12.080 Amendment to Section 903.3, Uniform Fire Code. Section 903.3
of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

903.3 Type of Water Supply.

A. Water supply is aliowed to consist of reservoirs, pressure tanks,
elevated tanks, water mains or other fixed systems capable of
providing the required fire flow. In setting the requirements for fire

flow, the ehief city of Gig Harbor Fire Marshal may-be-gnided-by
shall use Appendix HI-A of the Uniform Fire Code.
EXCEPTIONS:

WGH_SRV [WOL NUSERSIFLANNTNG'S TEVE\ORD-RESOTUBCORD.DOC -23-



1, Dwelli ¢ minimum fire 11ire; S fo ne- an
welll T Dw io; 1 be er

minute at 20 psi for a period of forty-five (45) minutes, Flre w for
buildings of three thousand gix hundred (3600) square feet or more in

floor area including attached garage, shall be one thousand (1,000)
for one (1) hour ire ection credits as described for

buifdings of 3600 square feet or more, duration of fire flow may be
reduced to not less than fortv—ﬁve (45) minutes when using fire
protection credits as described in Table 111 of this Section. Table I

may be usgd_ in lieu of providing fire flow for one- and two-family

in R Divisi when:
t of r0v1d1 fire flow exceed st o addi dr.
10 wat bl vidin least S f ﬁre W to

the building, portion of a building, or substantia a]l ation thereto,
[f the above fire flow can be provided by the addition of a hydrant,

the hydrant shall be installed. When at |east five hundred (500) GPM
is available from an approved hydrant it shall be credited toward the

required_fire flow. e additi fire flow requirement may be
vid inge fire protecti dits as described in Table [T1 in
rovidin itiona W,

{
The use of fire protection features fo reduce the required fire flow

may be considered by the fire marshal if a_review by the_fire

Qpartmgnt mdgca;es ];hgt the use gf fire prgt tlon teatures would

rovi
hgd the full fire flow be provided i_g accg@g t ig code. ife
d letter stating the pr ed 0 rotection shs

subputted to the fire marshal and fire department. The fire
department_must indicate approval of the proposed method of fire

rotection,_or £ ethod o that wosed before the fire

marshal may approve the alternate method of fire protection.

ildi lon of a buijldin tial alteration L

WGH_ SRV IWOLNUSERSWLANNINGSTEVINORD-RES\TUBCORD.DOC - 24 -



. required fire flow, The additjonal fire flow
reguirement may_be provided by using fire protection credits as
descrbed in Table I1i in liey of providing additional fire flow,

all of

5 et;

(i) - it is accessory to a one- or two-family dwelling

{Group R Division 3) that meets the requirements of

is jon; a
dip i ide t li fatle
ent et east tei feet from other

uildines on the same lot.

3, Other Buildings. Fire protection features consisting of approved
monitored automatic sprinkler system, or fire resistive building

constraction as specified in Appendix ITI-A, of the Uniform Fire
f providing the fu flow ired

Appendi -A_fi ildin er than and -famil

dwellings R_Division 3 rivate garages oup M

Division 1).

a. T i i flow I

WGH_SRVIWOLNUSERSPLANNING'S TEVENORD- RESWTUBCORD.DOC -25-




resistive bglldmg congm,;gn on as speci ﬁ d in Appendix HI-A

of't lieu of w, The

PTO

may I;gg ggngldgmd bx the ﬁre marghal 1f areview bvthef ire

district indicates that the rotection features would
rovide an equivalent fire pr 10n to that which wou
provided had the full fire flow be provided in accordance with

this code. A site plan and letter stating the proposed method
of fire protection shall be submitted to the fire marshal and

fire department. The fi indicate approval
of t roposed me i ternate
me hat ore the fir [OVE
the alternate method of fi i tion of fire flow

shall be the duration of the actual fire flow required_after
reductions for fire protection features described above.

4
;
Table Il
Fi ion Cr
Options to Reduce %) ofRe
Fire Flow {1) ) ] ] )
1-2L 341V 4LV
-35 -0 0

ite

Building < 3.500
i

Building > 3,600 =25 =0 Q
sq.fi.

WGH_SRVIWOLINUSERS\PLANNINGSTEVE'ORD-RES\$UBCORD. DOC -26 -



2
o]

NFEPA* 13 sprinkler -50
system (3)

NFPA* 13
monitored system

I
5

1
5

BPiA
s
"
S

30 fi. Min setback =25 =20 20
all PL ** (4) -

60 ft. Min setback =25 =30 30
all PL ** (4)

itored fir

alarm (3)

One-hour -15 =20 =20
construction (5)

Class A or B roof =15

2
5
I

2) May be taken if the responding fire department has the capability to

ovide area-wi -gpecific) off-site wate
(3) _ These reductions may not be taken together,

4 These reductions may not be taken together, The 30 ft. and 60 f}
setbacks are from side and rear property lines. Front setback may be

h nin

WGH_SRVIWOLIJSERSPLANNINGS TEVESORD-RESSTUBCORD DOC -27 -




* i Fir
**Property lines
- LV=living units

a. . Procedures for Compliance. The following shall be required for site
plan, subdivisions, short subdivisions and al] water systems:

Regquirements fi 1 subdijvisions;

(a) Upon submittal of site plan or preliminary plat, the
applicant shall submit to the Gig Harbor Fire Marshal,
a letter from the water authority addressing its

willingness and ability to satisfy the requirements of

this regulation.
(b) Prior to final plat approval, the following shall be
required:

i Water system plans and specifications
which comply with these regulations must be
designed and stamped by a registered professional
engineer. Said plans shall be signed by the purveyor

and must be approved by, and filed with the Gig
Harbor Fire Marshal and the Gig Harbor Public

Works Department,
1S § e approved
in writing by the Gig Harbor Fire Marshal
Har ic W irector.
111 The a ved wate term shall be installe

prer to final plat approval; bowgvgmtment rnay be
wawed 1f a bond or other security is posted a ;ggj app[gve
al. The curtt
a bgngj, shall be approved by the Gig HﬂLb.QLCL&'_Aﬂch)L
hg bond or security shall be in gn amognt sufficient I;Q pay

\WGH_SRY WOLBUSERSPLANNINGIS TEVEXORD-RESWTUBCORD DOC -28 -



iv) Two (2) copies of the "as built"

win W i
hal i i well as test
re wi nt of fire flow
hydrant at 20 p.s.i.
(©) When the distribution system is installed, said
tallat] ¢ under the direction 1
io i W 1 certi t the co 10n
of the systemn is in accordance with the approved design. In
t bond is posted, i i em must be
completed and operable, in accordance with this regulation,
i ancy or any ot ure.
f Short Subdivisi ite Plan

his regulation. Water

cl 1ons which comply with these re i e
designed and stamped by a registered professional engineer.
id plans shall be signed b rity and shall be
wi e Gig Harbor Fire ig Harbor Public

Works Director.
b W l hall 1 i

writl i arbor Fir hal a

Public Works Director.

c T ved water system must be installe

prior to the issuance of a building permit; provided that this
requirement m jved if ther security i
posted_and approved prior to said issuance. The form of
security, if other than a bond, shall be approved by the Gig
Harbor City Attomey. The amount of the bond or security
shall be determined by the water anthority supplying the
water. The bond or other security shall be issued o the City
i I 1be a ved ig Harbo

Public Works Di

WEH_SEVIWOL BUSERSUPLANNING S TEVEDORD-RESSTUBCORD- DOC - 29 -




(d 1 Affer the system is installed, two (2) co ples of

"as awl with 1¢ H
Marshal and Public Works Director. as well as test r§§u]ts

showing the amount of fire flow at each hvdrant at 20 p.s{.

(3 Requirements for Water System and Water Storage Plans.

{a) Prior to approval of new developments, water
system plans and specifications subject to these regulations,

must be designed and stamped b istered professignal
engineer. Said plans shall be sign e water guthority

ang shall be filed with the Gig Harbor Fire Marshal and (ig
Harbor Public Works Director.

ter storage and water system plans shall
in writing by t i bor Fire hal a
Harbor Public Works Director.

{c) Prior to final approval, two (2) copies of "as
built" drawings shall be filed with the Gig Harbor Fire

Marshal and Gig Harbor Public Works Director, as well as
test results showing the amount of fire flow at each hydrant at
20 p.s.i. as required by this ordinance. ;

0 W hority r ibili

Ihe water authority may be requested by the Gig Harbor Fire Marshal
o_indicate in writing its capability 1o prgvidg water service,

gs]stgnt with the s];anda,[ds contained 111 this chapter, to any
Ul it, su ubdivision, site plan applicant,
or to the City.

15.12.090 Amendment to Section 903.4.2, Uniform Fire Code. Section 903.4.2 of the
Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

903.4.2 Required installations.

A. The location, number and type of fire hydrants connecied to a water supply
capable of delivering the required fire flow shall be provided on the public
street or on the site of the premises or both to be protected as required and

approved bmmm&g.ﬂﬂmo:_ﬂ&mshal See Append1x III-B.
XAMPLE: 8 is pr: a de e lane to

WGHK_SRY IWOLNUSERSPPLANNING'S TEVEWORD-RESSIIBCORD.DOC - 30 -



in 150 f each i f the building, the dista casured to a

required fire fr f the fi hall ted in
a bmmm hg[[ bg (2 551 &gj; l§§§ 50 fee; in gcoordance wnth footnote 41 or 200
) ce from a fire hydrant to ion
ft ui in thi le will b eet r 350 feet,
B, W laced water mains (water mai ir excluded ea
minimum of eight (8") inches in diameter for dead-ends, and six (6"} inches
irculati ins ' that fi ad-end cul-de- ight (8"
inch main need d to i ire hydrant and normal
domestic mains may be installed thereafler to_the remaining residences,
Hydrant leads 1§§§ than fifty (50") feet in length shall be a minimum of six
6") inches i T, ain which extends across a street onl
for the pug:p_gsg of sgmng a bxdgang shall be of a size canable of providing
the re flow less than (6" i in diameter, Al
mains s ve or valv installed to conform with
this regulati tees or valves s required a

mission maj i 1o a transmission mam

w' 2 -and-one-h | L’ " h outl . and one

~and- " t let. Altwo and one-half {(2-1/2"
_ngh_l.nlﬂ_p_rts_and_ths_slgams_pm_ouﬂgtjmll have Natlonal St_da_rd
Hydrants the Ci i Harbor ic W rk
tandards. -and-one-half-i 4-1/2" ve fiv
5".inch ings

D. ere sh auxili i to_permit the air and
e the h wi i i water service

E. 1 all stand d be se e finish: ade. o)

W let of t hall ight ™ inches

fac es - er t be clearl defm do 'zed e

ort shall e most i approach and ion of the
ck while pumping, as determine the Gig H. Fire 1

WGH_SRVIWOLIWSERS\PLANNINGIS TEVEXORD-RESWIUBCORD.DOC -31-



E._ Hydrants shall not be obstructed by any structure or vegetation, or have the
visibility impai r a di e of fi 50" feet in the direction of
vehicular approach to the hydrant,

WOH_SEY1WOL KUSERSWPLANNINGSTEVE\ORP-RESYTUBCORD. DOC - 32 -



TABLE IX

I'ype of Development Hydrant Spacing**
ivisio d ubdivision -
Limited to Single Family Dwellings 600 feet
Multiple Dwelling - Low Density
Twelve ' 500 feet
mercial and ipl 11i !
igh Density - M v 400 feet
Units Per Acre
Industrial, Hospitals, Shopping
nters, Schools o : fee
an 20 Commerci i it

WGH_SRVIWOLNISERSWPLANNINGS TEVE\ORD-RESWTUBCORD. DOC

-33.




hundred (300" feet from the center of the frontage from the last Jot on the cul-de-sac,
and shall comply with the maximum spacing requirements listed above.

1. Commercial building requirements.

A, All new commercial buildings and substantial alterations (A
substantial alteration shall be defined as occurring when the value of construction is

in excess of 60% of the building valuation as determined b test Pierce County
Assessor’s valuation) to existing buildings sha rovided with water mains and
fire hydrants capable of supplyi reguired fire flow, ' i

n
be operational prior to bringing combustible materials to the site.

B. Change of occupancy from a lower to a higher ¢lassification per the
Uniform Building Code shall require that the existing building be provided with
water mains and fire hydrants capable of supplying the required fire flow per this
ordinance.

d additions so

C. Co ildi a portion i
than one hundred ﬁm ( 150_ } feet ﬁ_‘Qm a sfreet property line as measurgj by vehxculg:
travel shall have mains extended to them, with fire hydrants, capable of supplying the
required fire flow in accordance with Appendix {I[-A and III-B of the Uniform Fire
Code as adopted by the city of Gig Harbor. See Section ©03.4.2, UFC as amended
by Section 15.12.090 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code. ;

D. [he number Qf fire hyd gm% required shall be d g_n;g ned o @

average o thre 5 e d on an imagi
fro he up of buildings. The number number
of I ired shall be incr one ver two_stories and
ement.

The fire marshal shall determine the location of fire hvdranis
ependmg Q utility, topography and b_u].l ing location. ﬂyglmlg shall be a minimum

of fift ept when it impractical due t

EXCE S:

1. This requirgment shall not apply to those projects which have previously
received approval (and conform to the standards in effect at the time of

WGH_SREY WOL S ERSPLANNINGSTEYEQRD- RESSTUBCORD. DOC = 34 -



t ion) for adequa water or water sunply i re flow

the Ci fGi t f i of the ordinance codi
in this section.
2. This regui ha those projects where it been
cume to be impracti roperty lines or other site
ditions W ate me ection are provid

approved by the Fire Marshal.
E. The location of all water mains, fire hydrants, @d valves 10 _be

talled shall be ro and accurately m
of drawings, w. be prepared b i fessional
engineer. Two i 11 plans or drawi 1 mished to

the Gig Harbor Fire Marshal and Public Works Director prior to
installation.

G. After construction is completed, two copies of the "As Built"

drawings shall ith the Gig Harbor Fi hal and
Works Director 5 test results showi n
flow at each hydrant at 20 p.s.i,
15. ndment to Section 2.9, Uniform Fire i 3.2,
of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows: ;
Section 1003,2.9 Group R, Division 1 Occupancies.
Policy a €. el il finds that automati
sprinkle ms are i d economically viable
an I i roperty due to fir
ef necessary i er tect the
health, safe

B_._Aﬂ automatic spnnkler system shall be 1nstallcd throughout every

I e.g,, for the ses of hi i c

WGH_SRY WOLIVWSERSIPLANNING'S TEYEWO RD- RESYTUBCORD.DOC - 35 -



two (2) storie a ent s e considered
stories.). Residential or quick-response standard sprinkler heads shall
be used in the dwelling unit and guest room portions of the building.

The antomatic fire sprinkler system may be installed in accordance
with the requirements of Uniform Building Code Standard No. 9-3
for gll existing buildings housing Group R, Iggvlglon 1 gccupancies,

which are r or less stories in height. ings houst Ol
B_,, D'v' ion ccu ies ov ies in hejght, the sprinkler
e ingtalled in nce with the reguirements of

Un fgrm Bmlgmg g:Qde Standard 9-1. A Uniform Building Code
gmga rd 9-3 s ﬁt_em ;Q be installed in buildings with a height to

t hu -0CC r less than 75 above lowest fire
g_p ariment access. EQII e purpose of this Section, area separation
walls shall not define separate buildings,

C. Sprinkler Installation Requirements.
1. Automatic sprinklers shall be installed, tested and approved

in all existin and motels within five years of the
effective date of this section. Those existing hotels and
motels which are within annexed areas after the effective date
is_ordinance shall have automati inklers installed.
tested and approv ithin five vears after effective date

of the annexation.
2, An automatic sprinkjer system, in accordance with this

ection all uired to be installed immediatel

whgngvg} .

' . . o G Divisi
L—Abmng—dw"ﬁm‘mm'&—jﬁ 1 in subsection B of thi .On;w, n
bei tiall I : n

{Substantially remodeled or renovated shall be
ﬂiuﬂwmugﬂmmumum
gxcess of 60% of the building valuation ag
,E_:j;m ined by the latest Pierce County Assessor’

y ionY:

building classi as a Qr ivisj 1
occupancy incurs a fire with substantial damage
IS hstantial damage shall be defined as occurring

hen the damggg or loss valuation as estimated by
Plerce Fire De No. 5 or the fire

marshal is in excess of 60% of the building valuation

4GH_SRVIWOLINUSEAS\PLANNRNG\ST EVESORD: RESWTURCORD.DGC -36-



as determined by the latest Pierce County Assessor’s

- valuation),
3, In the there is a conflict between rovisions of
ion and visions of 1 ed I.C.B.
niform Building Code or the Uni i I

restrictive atest protection) provisi shall

15.12.110 Amendment to Section 1007.2.9.1.1, Uniform Fire Code. Section
1007.2.9.1.1 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 1007.2.9.1.1. General. Group R Occupancies shall be provided
with fire alarm systems in accordance with Section 1007.2.9. Group R,
Division 1 Qccupancies shall be provided with a manual and automatic ﬁre
alarm system in apariment houses three or more stories in height, or two o

more stories in height with a basement, or containing +6-e¥ more I.hgn_
dwelling units, and gyery i hotels and motel which contains six (6) or more

g]; §1 mgmg angl in conggegate residences three Of more stones in helght-ef

mef&séeﬂemhel ght or havmg an occupant load of 2Q or more. Scc also
Section 1007.2.12. A fire alarm and communication system shall be
provided in Group R, Division 1 Occupancies located in a high-rise building,

' :

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A manual fire alarm system need not be provided in buildings
not over two stories in height when all individual dwelling
units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from
each other and public or common areas by at least one-hour
fire-resistive occupancy separations and each individual
dwelling unit or guest room has an exit directly to a public

way, exit court or yard, exterior stairway or exterior exit
balcony.

2. A separate fire alarm system need not be provided in
buildings which are protected throughout by an approved
supervised fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with

the-Building Ceode Uniform Building Code Standard No. 9-1

and having a local alarm to notify all occupants.

Alarm syste) Divisi ies having interigr coiridors

8 m;ng asa m_qmm_cl exit for an Qg_c_upani load of ten or more §hall con§l§1 of

talled




within s;; ch comdo, with the acturers instructions.

When activated, such det QQIQIS shall initiate an alarm audible throughout the
building.

The fire fo R, Division 1 Occ cies other than those

specified ahove shall be provided with manual sending stations or equivalent
alternate protection in location as required by the city fire marshal.

An approved and list stem- utomat'c eat tor shall be installed
within common areas such as i ms, [a rooms and furnace

xo_mg_f_hmlslmgs_@_talmngﬁmup_&ﬂmmmm_up_mi

The detectors shall be installed on the ceiling or wall of such rooms in
agcordance with the manufacturer's installation instrugtions and. when

activated, shal] initiate an alarm which is audible thronghout the bujlding,
For the purpose of this Section, area separation walls shall not define separate
buildi

15.12.111 Amendment to Section 1007.2.9.2, Uniform Fire Code. Section
1007.2.9.2 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 1007.2.9.2 Existing Gronp R Occupancies.

1007.2.9.2.1 General. Existing Group R Occupancies not already provided
with single-station smoke detectors shall be provided with approved single-station
smoke detectors. Installation shall be in accordance with Section 1007.2.9.2

1007.2.9.2.2 Installation. Approved single-station smoke detectors shall be
installed in existing dwelling umits, congregate residences, and hotel and lodging
house guest rooms.

1007.2.9.2.3 Power Source. In Group R Occupancies, single-station

smoke detectors shall be-either-battery-operated-or-mey receive their primary

power from the building wiring provided that such wiring is served from a

commercial source. When-poweris-provided-by-the The building wiring,the

wiring shall be permanent and without a disconnecting switch other than

those required for overcurrent protection. Building owners or their agents
shall identify the sm € which are not wired t; THM, uildin
wiring, and shall install new smoke detectors with approved wiring to comply
with this requirement. Notification of compliance shall be sent to the Gig
Harbor brilding official/fire marshal,

WGH_SRV IVOLIVJSERS\PLANNNGS TEVEWRD-RESSTUBCORD DOC - 38 =



1007.2.9.2.4 Locations within existing Group R Occupancies. Indwelling units,

hotel, lodging house and congregate residences, detectors shall be mounted on the

ceiling or wall at a point centrally located in the corridor or area giving access to each
separate sleeping area. Where sleeping rooms are on an upper level, the detector

shall be placed at the senterofthe ceiling of the level in close proximity to

éEeet-ly—abeve the stmrway he ceiling hei fa Ioom open the hallwa
sl exceeds that of the hal

smoke detectors sball be installed in the haliway and in the adjacent room. Detectors

shall also be installed in the basement of dwelling units having a stajrway which

opens from the basement into the dwelling. Additional detectors shall be located in

each room used as a sleeping ropm.

15.12.120 Establishment of limits of distriets in which storage of compressed
natural gas is to be prohibited. The limits referred to in Section 5204.5.2 of the
Uniform Fire Code, in which storage of compressed natural gas is prohibited, are
established and shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force;
provided, however, that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for
such storage, where there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons
or property and where such storage would not be in conflict with other city codes.

15.12.130 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of explosives and
blasting agents is to be prohibited. The limits referred to in Section 7701.7.2 of the
Uniform Fire Code, in which storage of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited,
are established and shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in
force; provided, however, that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special
permit for such storage, where there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger
to persons or property and where such storage would not be in conflict with other city
codes.

15.12.140 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of flammable or
combustible liquids in ontside aboveground tanks is preohibited. The limits
referred to in Section 7902.2.2.1 and 7904.2.5.4.2 of the Uniform Fire Code, in
which storage of flammable or combustible liquids is restricted are hereby
established and shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force;
provided, however, that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for

WGH_SRY IWOLNUSERSWLANNINGIS TEVEVORD-RESWTUBCORD. DQC - 39 -



such storage, where there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons
or property and where such storage would not be in conflict with other city codes.

15.12.150 Establishment of limits in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas
is prohibited. The limits referred to in Section 8204.2 of the Uniform Fire Code, in
which bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are hereby established and
shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force; provided,
however, that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for such
storage, where there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons or
property and where such storage would not be in conflict with other Gig Harbor city
codes.

15.12.151 Establishment of limits of districts in which the storage of stationary
tanks of flammable cryogenic fluids axe to be prohibited. The limits referred to
in Section 3-1.5 of the Uniform Fire Code Standard 80-3 in the storage of flammable
cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is restricted, are hereby established and shall
apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force; provided, however, that
the office of the fire marshal may 1ssue a special permit for such storage, where there
appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons or property and where such
storage would not be in conflict with other Gig Harbor city codes.

15.12.152 Establishment of limits of districts in which the storage of hazardous
materials is to be prohibited or limited. The limits referred to in Section 8001.1.},
of the Uniform Firz Code, in which the storage of hazardous materials is limited, are
hereby established and shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in
force; provided, however, that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special
permit for such storage, where there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger
to persons or property and where such storage would not be in conflict with other Gig
Harbor city codes.

15.12.160 Amendment tc Section 8504, Uniform Fire Code. Section 8504 of the
Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 8504 - Abatement of Electrical Hazards. When electrical hazards are
identified, measures to abate such conditions shall be taken. Identified hazardous
electrical conditions in permanent wiring or temporary wiring corrected in
cooperation with the authority enforcing the Electrical Code. A final inspection and

cettificate of occupancy will not be issued by the City of Gig Harbor lzgpgr_tmgm of
Planning _and _Building without receipt _of documentation showing that the
Washington State Djvision abor_and Indugtri ide ol

a
electrical ispections to jdentify and obtain the correction of any electrical hazards

NGH_SRY IVOL NUSERSWPLANNINGSTEVEWRD-RESETUBCORD. DOC - 40 -



A, underground work prior to cover;

B. roughing in wiring prior to cover;
inal prior to oc :and
D. other requested inspections when a hazard has been identified by the
rbor Fire Marsh thori

Electrical wiring, devices, appliances and other equipment which are
modified or damaged and constitute an electrical shock or fire hazard shall
not be used.

15.12.170 Amendment to Appendix II-C, Uniform Fire Code. Appendix III-
C of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 1 General Inspection, testing and maintenance of water-based fire-
protection systems shall be in accordance with UFC Appendix Standard A-

II1-C-1. Ihg 1§§1§ Qs];abllsh.gsi by Appgndug III-C shall be cond;;g;ggl b}: a

m or dewce he owner ha] - 1 u h

15.12.180 Amendments to Section 6.3, Appendix II-C Uniform Fire Code.
Section 6.3, Appendix II-C of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

6.3 Access and Water Supply. Piers and wharves shall be provided with
fire apparatus access roads and water-supply systems with on-site fire

hydrants when required by the ehief City of Gig Harbor Fire Marshal. Such

roads and water systems shall be provided and maintained in accordance with

Sections 902.2 and 903 The minimum fire flow at each hose station shall
E : A fire flow analvsis ] o the 19741 uide
I -approved method i itted to the Gi
Harbor Fire Marshal for approval.

[See printed copy of Appendix A, Section #15.12.090; fig. 15.12.090 attached)

Section 10. Chapter 15.32 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

WGH_SRVBVOLINISERS\PPLANNINGS TEVEW RD-RESSTUBCORD. DOC = 4]. -




Section 11. A new chapter 15.32 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Code,
to read as follows:

Chapter 15.32
WASHINGTON STATE ENERGY CODE

Sections:
15.32.005 Ventilation and indoor air quality code adopted.

15.32.010 Energy code adopted.
15.32.011 Nonresidential Energy Code adopted.

15.32.005 Veatilation and indoor air quality code adopted. The Washington State
Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality Code as adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council
(WSBCC), and published as Chapter 51-13 WAC is adopted by reference for use within the city of

Gig Harbor.

15.32.010 Energy code adopted. The Washington State Energy Code as adopted by the
Washington State Building Code Council (WSBCC), and published as Chapter 51-11 WAC is
adopted by reference for use within the city of Gig Harbor.

15.32.011 Nonresidential Energy Code adopted. The Nonresidential Energy Code as adopted
by the Washington State Building Code Council (WSBCC), and published as Chapters 51-11
through 51-20 WAC, is adopted by reference for use within the city of Gig Harboxr.

ction 12. Section 15.18.002 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code, is hereby amended to
read as follows:

15.18.02 Yiolations.

A. Building Code Violation. Building code violations are described in the Uniforin
Building Code (UBC) Section 203 103, as the same now exists or may hereafter be
amended.

B. Plumbing Code Violation. Plumbing code violations are described in the Uniform
Plumbing Code {(UPC) Section 203 102.3.1, as the same now ¢xists or may hereafter be
amended.

C. Mechanical Code Violation. Mechanical code violations are described in the Uniform
Mechanical Code (UMC) Section 284 111, as the same now exists or may hercafter be
amended.

D. Fire Code Violation. Fire code violations are described in the Uniform Fire Code
(UFC) Article 3 103.4, as the same now exists or may hereafler be amended.

WGH_SEY WOLIWSERSWPLANNTNG S TEVEWORD-RESWIUBCORD DOC - 42 -



E. Energy Code Violation. Energy code violations are described in WAC 51-11-0106, as
the same now exists or may hereafter be amended.

F. Indoor Air -Quality Violation. Indoor Air Quality code violations are described in
WAC 51-13-107, as the same now exists or may hereafter be amended. '

G. Additional Violations. In addition to the above, it is a violation of GHMC Title 15 to:

1. Remove or deface any sign, notice, complaint or order required by or posted in
accordance with this chapter;

2. To misrepresent any material fact in any application, plans or other information
submitted to obtain any building or construction authorization;

3. Fail to comply with any of the requirements of GHMC Title 15, including any
requirement of the Uniform Codes and state codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 13. Severability. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance should
be held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, sentence, clause or
phrase of this ordinance. ;

Section 14. Copies of the 1997 editions of the Uniform Building Code, the Uniform Fire
Code, the Uniform Mechanical Code, Uniform Plumbing Code and the Washington Administrative Code
chapters 51-11, 51-13, 51-19, 51-20, 51-26, 51-40, 51-42, 51-44 and 51-45, as adopted by reference in this
ordinance, are hereby filed with this ordinance with the City Clerk.

Section 15. Effective Date - This ordinance, after publication, shall be effective on July 1,
1998, to coincide with the effective date of the State Building Code, on July 1, 1998, as adopted by the State
Legislature.

APPROVED:

Gretchen A. Wilbert, Mayor
ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

Molly Towslee, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:

WGH_SRVIWVOLIWUSERSPLANNING'S TEVE\ORD-RESOTUBCORD. DOC -43 -




BY
FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: 5/15/98
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL: 6/8/98
PUBLISHED: |

EFFECTIVE DATE: 7/1/98

ORDINANCENO.

WGH_SRY (WOL IWSERS\PLANNINGIS TEVERD-RESSTUBCORD. DOC -44 -



City of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime City.”

3105 JUDSON STREET
GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 98335
(253} 851-8136

TO: MAYOR WILBERT AND CITY COUNCIL MEMBERS
FROM:  MARK HOPPEN, CITY ADMINISTRATOR /// <&~
DATE: JUNE 3, 1998

SUBJECT: MANAGEMENT OF JERISICH PARK DOCK ORDINANCES

INFORMATION/BACKGROUND

Attached is a survey of various dock facilities throughout Puget Sound which indicates fee
structure and services. Interestingly, our current $.25 charge per foot appears to be about on par
with area fees with respect to the services provided.

POLICY CONSIDERATIONS

A choice that Council should make is whether or not to stay with the 24 continuous hour limit
and the 24 hour limit in any seven day period. Staff recommends changing the period in both
cases to 48 hours. '

Currently, we use the honor system with envelope payment to a dock box. This is a relatively
common method. Staff recommends posting the time for payment as anytime from 7:00 p.m. to
7:00 am. This would require minor changes to GHMC Chapter 3.28 City Dock Moorage Fees.
The Police Department will make evening review of permits a part of its regular routine.
Moreover, our envelope system has been altered to allow coordination of police documentation
of permits with the actual remittance of fees in envelopes. No police officer, however, will have
immediate access to envelopes. Only staff from the Finance Department will handle envelopes
as per acceptable financial practice.

Additionally, staff recommends that GHMC 8.28.065 Unloading/loading zones delete language
that refers to a 65° limit for unloading and loading space. Other than the above issues GHMC
Chapter 8.28 appears to have no administrative provisions which require alteration for better
management.

FISCAL CONSIDERATIONS
Any effect on city revenues can be evaluated after the next budget cycle.

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends approval of the attached ordinances after this reading.




ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR,
WASHINGTON, RELATING TO PUBLIC DOCK
MOORAGE FEES, CLARIFYING THE TIME LIMITS FOR
OVERNIGHT MOORAGE AND THE PENALTY FOR NON-
PAYMENT OF MOORAGE FEES; AMENDING SECTIONS
3.28.010 AND 3.28.020 OF THE GIG HARBOR MUNICIPAL
CODE.

WHEREAS, the current code provisions relating to moorage time limitations are

unclear and unenforceable; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the code should be amended to properly

reflect the moorage requirements and penalties; now, therefore,

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON, DO

ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 3.28.010 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby dmended

to read as follows:

3.28.010 Rates Established.

There-are-astablished The following rates shall be to-be-assessed
charged against-boats-and-other—watersraft for avernight moorage

meored—overnight at the Gig Harbor City Dock moorage facility:

$.025 per foot per day night.

For the purpose of this chapter, each day pight shall be defined as the

period fromS OOnm t0700 a.tm. eens&m%esra-ﬁeﬁed-ef—y—hews

Section 2. Section 3.28.020 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby amended

to read as follows:

198208



3.28.020 Penalty.

It shall be a violation of GHMC [13.28.010 for the owner or operator

of a vessel or watercraft moored for a night at the City Dock to fail

to pay the fee descnbed therem Such v101at10n shall be vielations-of

£ a-shi : s-an-infraction—of punishable by

a cwll ﬁne of $100 00 for each dagf ni ht the moorage fee has not
been paid.

Section 3. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance should be held
to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, sentence,
clause or phrase of this ordinance.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force five (5) days after
publication of an approved summary consisting of the title.

APPROVED:

i

MAYOR, GRETCHEN A. WILBERT

ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

CITY CLERK, MOLLY TOWSLEE

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:

BY

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: 5/20/98
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL:
PUBLISHED:

EFFECTIVE DATE:

ORDINANCE NO.

158208 -2-




SUMMARY OF ORDINANCE NO.

of the City of Gig Harbor, Washington

Onthe  dayof , 199, the City Council of the City of Gig Harbor,
passed Ordinance No. . A summary of the content of said ordinance, consisting of
the title, provides as follows:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GIG HAREBOR,
WASHINGTON, RELATING TO PUBLIC DOCK
MOORAGE FEES, CLARIFYING THE TIME LIMITS FOR
OVERNIGHT MOORAGE AND THE PENALTY FOR NON-
PAYMENT OF MOORAGE FEES; AMENDING SECTIONS
3.28.010 AND 3.28.020 OF THE GIG HARBOR MUNICIPAL
CODE.

The full text of this Ordinance will be mailed upon request.

DATED this day of ,199 .

CITY CLERK, MOLLY TOWSLEE



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR,
WASHINGTON, RELATING TO THE CITY PUBLIC DOCK,
CHANGING THE MOORING TIME LIMIT FOR VESSELS
AT THE DOCK FROM 24 TO 48 HOURS, AND
ELIMINATING THE LIMITATIONS ON THE AREA TO BE
USED FOR UNLOADING AND LOADING PASSENGERS
ON THE DOCK, AMENDING SECTIONS 8.28.040 AND
8.28.065 OF THE GIG HARBOR MUNICIPAL CODE.

WHEREAS, the current mooring time limit at the public dock is set for a period not

1o exceed 24 continuous hours within any seven day period; and

WHEREAS, a restriction exists on the area of the dock to be used for unloading and

loading of passengers; AND

actual and normal moorage patterns for public dock users to increase the moorage time limit from

24 continuous hours to 48 continuous hours, and to eliminate any restrictions on the area on the

WHEREAS, the City Council believes that it would promote tourism and reflect

dock to be used for loading and unloading by passengers; now, therefore,

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON, DO

ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 8.28.050 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby amended

to read as follows;

8.28.040 Mooring Time Limit.

Boats may moor to the dock for a period not to exceed 24 48
continuous hours. A boat shall not be moored at the dock for more
than one 24 48 hour period within any seven day period. A boat
shall not be moored at the dock in excess of 24 48 hours for any
seven-day period whether continuous or not.




Section 2. Section §.28.065 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby amended
to read as follows:

8.28.065 Unloading/loading Zones.

A portion of the dock nette-exeeed-65feet shall be set aside and
clearly marked and signed on the city dock for unloading and
loading of watercraft passengers.  Watercraft may use the
unloading/loading zone only for the purpose of unloadmg and

fén:ialﬁ on board while temporarily moored at the city dock; and such

watercraft shall be moved from the unloading/loading zone either

immediately after passengers have disembarked or if another

watercraft needs to use the unloading/loading area.

Section 3. [f any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance should be held

to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or

unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, sentence,
clause or phrase of this ordinance.
Section 4. This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force five (5) days after

publication of an approved surnmary consisting of the title.

APPROVED:

MAYOR, GRETCHEN A. WILBERT

ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

CITY CLERK, MOLLY TOWSLEE

198206 -2~



APPROVED AS TO FORM:
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:

BY

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: 5/20/98
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL:
PUBLISHED:

EFFECTIVE DATE:

ORDINANCE NO.

198206



SUMMARY OF ORDINANCE NO.

of the City of Gig Harbor, Washington

On the day of , 199, the City Council of the City of Gig Harbor,
passed Ordinance No. . A summary of the content of said ordinance, consisting of
the title, provides as follows:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR,
WASHINGTON, RELATING TO THE CITY PUBLIC DOCK,
CHANGING THE MOORING TIME LIMIT FOR VESSELS
AT THE DOCK FROM 24 TO 48 HOURS, AND
ELIMINATING THE LIMITATIONS ON THE AREA TO BE
USED FOR UNLOADING AND LOADING PASSENGERS
ON THE DOCK, AMENDING SECTIONS 8.28.040 AND
8.28.065 OF THE GIG HARBOR MUNICIPAL CODE.

The full text of this Ordinance will be mailed upon request.

DATED this _ day of , 199 .

CITY CLERK, MOLLY TOWSLEE

CAMI19R8206_LOFOD08.120,001/BOD0S.



City of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime City.”

3105 JUDSON STREET
CIG HARBOR, WASHINCTON 98335
{(253) 851-8136

TO: MAYOR WILBERT AND CITY COUNCIL MEMBERS
¥ROM: WES HILL, P.E., PUBLIC WORKS DIRECTOR 75 Z/
SUBJECT: PURCHASE AUTHORIZATION

DATE: JUNE 3, 1988

INTRODUCTION/BACKGROUND

The 1998 budget provides $18,000 for purchase of a trailer air compressor, and compressed-air
powered jackhammer and boring unit. The equipment will be used for utility work and street
repairs.

Staff evaluated several different trailer air compressors, and determined that the Ingersoll-Rand
P160WID, with a 90-pound jack hammer provided the best performance characteristics relative
to our requirements.

Price quotations were obtained from three vendors in accordance with the City’s Small Works
Roster process for the purchase of equipment (Resolution 411). The price quotations are
summarized below:

Respondent Base Amt. Sales Tax Total
Construction Machinery, Inc. $11,883.33 $1,021.97 $ 12,905.30
U.S. Rentals. $ 12,355.00 $1,037.82 $ 13,392.82
Modern Machinery $ 13,500.00 $1,112.00 $ 15,012.00

The lowest price quotation received was from Construction Machinery, Inc. of Seattle, in the
amount of $12,905.30, including state sales tax.

ISSUES/FISCAL IMPACT
Budgeted funds are available for purchase of the trailer air compressor and jackhammer.

RECOMMENDATION _

Staff recommends that Council authorize purchase of the trailer air compressor and jackhammer
from Construction Machinery, Inc., as the lowest responsible respondent, for their price
quotation proposal amount of twelve-thousand nine-hundred five dollars and thirty cents
($12,905.30), including state sales tax.

AIRCMOJH_







WASHINGTON STATE LIQUOR CONTROL BOARD
License Bivision - 1025 E. Union, P.0. Box 43075
Olympia, WA 98504-3075

(360) 664-0D012

RETURN TO:

TO: CITY OF GI& HARBOR DATE: 5/29/98

RE: ASSUMFTION
From R & M LUSTIG, INC.
Dba CAPTAIN'S TERRACE APPLICANTS:

JT'S ORIGINAL LOUISTANA BAR-B-QUE, LLC

TAN, JU X

License: 078469 - 2E County: 27 ’ 01-25-61 303-92-6395
TAN, GILLIAHM

Tradename: JT'S ORIGINAL LOUISIANA BAR-B-QUE {Spousel} 09-02-564 111-11-1111

Lec Addr: 4116 HAREORVIEW DR TURMNER, JAMES R

GIG HAREOR WA 983355 01-26-51 456~B0-33364

TURNER, ELSIE A

Mail Addr: 4116 HARBORVIEW DR ‘ (Spouse) 12-01-52 435-86-4226

GIG HARBDR WA 98335-1080
Phena Nao,: 253%3-858-1070 JAMES TURMNER

Classes Applied For:

A Restaurant or dining place - Beer on premises
C Wine on premises

E Beer by bottle or package - off premises

As required by RCW 66.24.010(8), you are notified that application has been made to the Washington

State Liquor Control Board for a license to conduct business. If return of this notice is not received in

this office within 20 DAYS from the date above, it will be assumed that you have no objection to the issuance
of the license. If additional time is required you must submit a written request for an extension of up

to 20 days. An extension of more than 20 days will be approved only under extraordinary circumstances.

1.Doyouapproveof applicant 2...... ..o i i e -4 |j
2.Doyouapprove of Iocation ? ... .ooi i i iiitas e aeeeees ][O
3. If you disapprove and the Board contemplates issuing a license, do you want a hearing

before final acton IS tAKEN? . . ..ottt i i e e e e e 30O

If you have indicated disapproval of the applicant, location or both, please submit a statement of all facts
upon which such objections are based.

DAIE SIGHATURE OF MAYOR,CITY MANAGER,COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OR DESIGNEE

Coy0044/LIBRINS




co91080-2 WASHINGTON STATE LIQUOR CONTROL BOARD DATE: 6/03/98

} ICENSED ESTABLISHMENTS IN INCORPORATED AREAS CITY OF GIG HARBOR
(BY ZIP CODE) FOR EXPIRATION DATE OF 19%80831

LICENSE
LICENSEE BEUSIHESS MAME ANLD ADDRESS NUMBER PRIVILEGES
1  HARBOR HUMIDOR IHC. HARBOR HUMIDOR 080669 SNACK BAR
3123 56TH ST NW STE &
GIG HARBOR WA 98335 00060
2 ANDRADE'S, INC. PUERTO VALLARTA - GIG HARBOR #2 364637 SPIRITS/BR/WN REST LOUNGE +
4225 HARBORVIEW DR
GIG HARBOR Wa 98335 0000
3  PENDRAGON MANAGEMENT CO., & PA ROUND TABLE PIZZA 076725 BEER/WINE REST - BEER/WINE
WYVERN RESTAURANTS, INC. 5500 OLYMPIC DR BLDG H
CAROL M VINUM GIG HARBOR WA 98335 0000

MICHAEL MC CIMPSEY
MICHELLE MC GIMPSEY

RECEIVED
JUN 4 - 1998

CITY OF GG NAnwon



